
 

 

On Thu, Sep 7, 2017 at 8:47 AM IJECE Journal <ijece@iaesjournal.com> wrote: 
Dear Dr. Irfan Syamsuddin, PhD 
 
It is my great pleasure to inform you that your paper is accepted and will be published 
on the International Journal of Electrical and Computer Engineering (IJECE), a Scopus 
indexed journal. Congratulations! 
Please prepare your final paper and follow the guide 
at: http://www.iaesjournal.com/online/index.php/IJECE/about/editorialPolicies#custom-3 
 
This journal is an OPEN ACCES. Why publish open access? IAES open access authors 
benefit from: Quality, established and reputable journal, reaching key audiences' with 5 
million users per month, high citations, etc. Benefits of the OPEN ACCESS policy: 
- Researchers as authors: immediate visibility for research output and thus increased 
visibility and usage of their results. Open Access may even lead to an increase of 
impact. 
- Researchers looking for information: access to literature everywhere, not only from a 
campus but also from any site with wifi access. 
- Funding agencies: increased return on investment (ROI), increased visibility. 
- Universities & research institutes: greater visibility, clearer management information. 
- Libraries: increased access for target audience, financially a more attractive model 
than the current subscription model. 
- Teachers & students: unrestricted access to material, enriched education, allowing 
equality of learning in poor as well as in rich nations. 
- Science: enhanced and accellerated research cycle. 
- Citizens & society: access to knowledge / access to the results of publicly funded 
research. 
- Enterprises: access to critical information. 
- Publishers: transparent business model, ultimate online article distribution, ultimate 
visibility for articles. 
 
So, Open access fee is paid by the authors, or on their behalf to support the cost of 
wide open access dissemination of research results, to pay deposit to CrossRef in order 
to each published articles has a Digital Object Identifier (DOI), to manage the various 
costs associated with handling and editing of the submitted manuscripts, and the 
Journal management and publication in general. 
 
Each accepted paper will be charged:  USD 225 (IDR 2,900K) 
(Add USD35 for including journal hardcopy delivery to Corresponding Author) 
This charge is for the first 8 pages, and if any published manuscript over 8 pages will 
incur extra charges USD40 per page 
(http://www.iaesjournal.com/online/index.php/IJECE/about/submissions#authorFees) 
 
The payment should be made by bank transfer (T/T): 
Bank Account name/Beneficiary: LEMBAGA INSTITUTE OF ADVANCED 



ENGINEERING AND SCIENCE (IAES) 
Bank Name: Bank Mandiri, 
Branch Office: Yogyakarta KotaGede 
City: Yogyakarta 
Country : Indonesia 
Bank Account #  : 1370011829211 (USD account), or 
Bank Account #  : 1370011829203 (IDR account) 
SWIFT Code: BMRIIDJAXXX 
or (as alternative), You is simple to pay the fee by using PayPal 
(https://www.paypal.com/webapps/mpp/send-money-online) to email: tole@ee.uad.ac.id 
 
Your paper will be scheduled after your payment reached us 
Please concurrently submit your payment receipt and inform your detailed address (for 
hardcopy delivering) within 3 weeks to email: IJECE@iaesjournal.com 
 
We really appreciate your total commitment to supporting this journal. 
 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards, 
T. Sutikno 
Editor 
IJECE@iaesjournal.com 
http://www.iaesjournal.com/online/index.php/IJECE 
 
-- 

only paper with collaboration authors will be considered for publication 
 
 

 
On Fri, Aug 11, 2017 at 1:04 AM, Irfan Syamsuddin <irfans@poliupg.ac.id> wrote: 
Dear Editor, 
 
Regarding my submission to IJECE, please find two attachment files. 
 
First file is my submission to IJECE which is the extended version of my EECSI 2014 
paper (IJECE-irfan.doc). 
 
Second file is my EECSI 2014 paper in order to ease you identify the difference 
between both papers.(353-443-1-SM.pdf) 
 
I really hope the paper can meet the requirements to get published in IJECE journal. 
 
Your kind advice will be very appreciated. 



 
Thank you very much 
 
Best regards, 
 
 
Irfan Syamsuddin, PhD 
CAIR - Center for Applied ICT Research  
Dept of Computer and Networking Engineering 
School of Electrical Engineering 
Politeknik Negeri Ujung Pandang 
Makassar 90123 
INDONESIA 
 
 
 


