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---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Anthony Robinson <revision.hrpub@gmail.com>
To: zubairsaing@ummu.ac.id
Cc: 
Bcc: 
Date: Fri, 23 Sep 2022 19:11:20 +0800
Subject: Acceptance Letter & Advice of Payment (ID:14828870)-Flood Modelling due to Dam Failure Using HEC-RAS
2D with GIS Overlay: Case Study of Karalloe Dam in South Sulawesi Province Indonesia
Dear Zubair Saing,

Your paper has been accepted for publication. Herewith attached is the Acceptance Letter.

Please download the publication agreement (http://www.hrpub.org/download/HRPUB_Publication_
Agreement2022.pdf) and fill in the authors' names, manuscript title, manuscript ID and signature, then send a scanned
version to us.

The publication fee is $480. Below are Wire Transfer instructions.

Beneficiary name: HORIZON RESEARCH PUBLISHING CO., LTD
Beneficiary account number:  33113742
Banking Swift code for international wires: CATHUS6L
Beneficiary bank name: Cathay Bank
Beneficiary bank address: 4128 Temple City Blvd, Rosemead, CA 91770 United States
Note: Please add $35.00 for wire transfer fee.

The bank charge would be deducted prior to the receipt of the payment. To avoid a shortfall on the net amount
received and request for repayment, authors shall pay the commission charge while making the payment.

Once the payment is finished, please inform us or send the remittance bill to us.

Best Regards

Anthony Robinson
Editorial Assistant
revision.hrpub@gmail.com
Horizon Research Publishing, USA
http://www.hrpub.org
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HRPUB Publication Agreement

Horizon Research Putrlishing (HRPffB) is a rvorldwide open access publisher r,vith oyer 50 peer-reviewed journals covering a

wide range of academic disciplines. As an intemational acaderlic organization, rve aim to enhance the academic atrnosphere,
show the outstandirg research achievement in a broad range of areas. and to thcilitate the academic exchange between
researcirers.

The LICONSEE is Iforizon Research Publishing (I{RPUB), and

The LICENS611;. RISWAL KARAMMA

The purpose of this agreernent is to estatrlish a rmrtually bene{lcial rvorking relationship between The LICENSEE and The
LICENSOR.

WHEREAS it is the goal of the LICENSEE to provide an open access platf-omr and
WHEREAS the LICENSOR is rn'illing to fumish electronically readable tiles in accordance with the tenns of this Agreenent:

Manuscript Title: Fld Modelling due to Dam Failure Using HEC-RAS 2D with GIS Overlay: Case Study of Karalloe Dam in South Sulawesi Province lndonesia

Manuscript tD: 14828870

It is mutually agreed as follov,.s:

COPIRIGHT:
1. LICENSOR retains all copyright interest or it is retained by other copyright holder, as appropriate and agrees tirat the

rnanuscript remains penlanently open access in LICENSEE's site under the ternr.s of one of the following flreative Comr.nons
Licenses:

f)-eative Comrnons Attribution International License (ClC BY)

I*l Creative Cornrnons Attribution-NonCommercial International License (CC-BY-NC)

LICENSEE shall have the right to use and archive the content for the prirpose of creatin-a a HRPUB record and may refonnat
or paraphrase to benefit the display of the HRPUB record.

LICENSEE RESPONSIBILITIES :

2. LICENSEE sirall:
a. Correct significant errors to pr"rblished records tbr critical fields. described as the title. author, or bibliographic citation fields;
b. Provide free access to the full-text content of published articles;
c. Provide availability to the perpetual archive with exception 1br rmavailability due to maintenance of the server. installation

or testing of soitware. loading of data, or dou.ntime outside the control of the LICENSEE.

LICENSOR RESPONSIBILITIES:
3. LICENSOR shall confinu that:
a. Copyright of the rnaterial in your manuscript which is not your own must be cleared;
b. The marurscript is original. tiee from plagiarism, has not been published previously and is not under consideration tbr

pirbl ication clseu,hcrc:
o. All of the facts contained in the material are tnre and accurate:
d. Nothing in tire rnaterial is unlawflil or libelous;
e. Conflict of interest is declared clearly in the manuscript.

Please sign b indicate acceptance of this Agreement.

LICENSOR LICENSEE - Horizon Research ltublishinp

frl^ li^,rn+,ta.+:
Signature of Ailhorized LICIENSOR Representative

26th of September 2022
Signahrre of HRPUB Officer
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Date: 09/30/2022 [09:56:02 AM +08]
From: zubairsaing@ummu.ac.id
To: Anthony Robinson <revision.hrpub@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Acceptance Letter & Advice of Payment (ID:14828870)-Flood Modelling due to Dam Failure Using
HEC-RAS 2D with GIS Overlay: Case Study of Karalloe Dam in South Sulawesi Province Indonesia

Dear Anthony Robinson,

Thank you for your acceptance letter notification email. We have made the payment fee, and sent it with
publication agreement as attached. Kindly check the attachment file below. We are waiting for your response
as soon as possible.

Kind regards,

Zubair Saing
The author

Quoting Anthony Robinson <revision.hrpub@gmail.com>:

Dear Zubair Saing,

Your paper has been accepted for publication. Herewith attached is the
Acceptance Letter.

Please download the publication agreement (
http://www.hrpub.org/download/HRPUB_Publication_Agreement2022.pdf) and fill
in the authors' names, manuscript title, manuscript ID and signature, then
send a scanned version to us.

The publication fee is $480. Below are Wire Transfer instructions.

Beneficiary name: HORIZON RESEARCH PUBLISHING CO., LTD
Beneficiary account number:  33113742
Banking Swift code for international wires: CATHUS6L
Beneficiary bank name: Cathay Bank
Beneficiary bank address: 4128 Temple City Blvd, Rosemead, CA 91770 United
States
Note: Please add $35.00 for wire transfer fee.

The bank charge would be deducted prior to the receipt of the payment. To
avoid a shortfall on the net amount received and request for repayment,
authors shall pay the commission charge while making the payment.

Once the payment is finished, please inform us or send the remittance bill
to us.

Best Regards

Anthony Robinson
Editorial Assistant
revision.hrpub@gmail.com
Horizon Research Publishing, USA
http://www.hrpub.org
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