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--------- Forwarded message ------m--

Dari: ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl>

Date: Sab, 31 Jul 2021 pukul 02.32

Subject: RE: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal
To: A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddiq@poliupg.ac.id>

We confirm receiving of the paper - registered as PEG450.

Please refer always (!) to this number in correspondence.

After acceptation of the paper authors are requested to cover the printing cost with reasonable amont: 35 Euro page b/w and 50 Euro in color.

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Przeglad Elektrotechniczny (Electrical Review)
Editor in Chief

ul. Ratuszowa 11

00-950 Warszawa

e-mail: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

www.red.pe.org.pl

tel (mobile): 48 693 428 056
tel. (private): 48 22 711 0303

e-mail: tumanski@tumanski.pl

From: A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD [mailto:shiddig@poliupg.ac.id]
Sent: Friday, July 30, 2021 3:28 PM

To: ST; red.pe@sigma-not.pl

Subject: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal

Dear Prof. Slawomir Tumanski,

We would like to submit our original paper entitled, “Assessment of Flange Diffuser Structures to Improve the Power Generation of a Diffuser Augmented
Wind Turbine”. This paper is original and not under submission to another journal. All authors agree to submit it in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal.

Thank you very much for your kind attention and wish our manuscript could be considered to publish in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal.

Best Regards,



From: A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD [mailto:shiddiq@poliupg.ac.id]

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 3:09 AM

To: tumanski@tumanski.pl

Subject: [Norton AntiSpam]Re: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal

Dear Prof. Slawomir Tumanski,

| would like to ask about the progress of our submitted paper (PE6450) entitled: “Assessment of Flange Diffuser Structures to Improve the Power Generation of a
Diffuser Augmented Wind Turbine”.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Warmest Regards,

A. M. Shiddiq Yunus

Dari: ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl>

Date: Min, 5 Des 2021 pukul 03.45

Subject: RE: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal
To: A. M. Shiddig Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddig@poliupg.ac.id>

Review enclosed - we are waiting for final version and data for invoice (the best name and address of your University)

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Przeglad Elektrotechniczny (Electrical Review)
Editor in Chief

ul. Ratuszowa 11

00-950 Warszawa

e-mail: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

www.red.pe.org.pl

tel (mobile): 48 693 428 056
tel. (private): 48 22 711 0303

e-mail: tumanski@tumanski.pl

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor
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Dear Prof Tumanski,

Thanks for this kind information and we would like to apologize for the late reply due to workload during the final year closed book 2021. Could you please provide
us with the article processing charge (APC) that we should pay?. We are waiting for your kind reply.

Best Regards,

Pada tanggal Sab, 31 Jul 2021 pukul 16.32 ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl> menulis:

We confirm receiving of the paper - registered as PE6450.

Please refer always (!) to this number in correspondence.

After acceptation of the paper authors are requested to cover the printing cost with reasonable amont: 35 Euro page b/w and 50 Euro in color.

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Dari: 8T <tumanski@tumanski.pl>

Date: Sen, 7 Feb 2022 pukul 17.57

Subject: RE: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal
To: A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddig@poliupg.ac.id>

Invoice enclosed.

You can pay by bank transfer or by credit card.

We recommend payments by credit cards using new possibility to pay by PayPal service because this way we receive the payment immediately.
To pay by this way please send us e-mail address and PayPal will contact with you on this address to help to pay. You can pay using your PayPal account (you can open such
account in a few second free of charge) or you can pay without PayPal account as a guest.

PayPal account is: red.pe@sigma-not.pl



You can also pay by bank transfer.
Important: if you pay by bank transfer always!!!! Send information about number of invoice PEL... because it is a method of identification of the
payment.

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Warsaw University of Technology
IETiSIP

ul. Koszykowa 75

00-661 Warszawa

tel (mobile): 48 693 428 056
tel. (private): 48 22 711 0303

e-mail tumanski@tumanski.x.pl

Przeglad Elektrotechniczny (Electrical Review)
Editor in Chief

ul. Ratuszowa 11

00-950 Warszawa

e-mail: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

wwe.red.pe.org.pl

Sent: Wednesday, February 2, 2022 4:57 AM

To: tumanski@tumanski.pl

Subject: Re: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal
Dear Prof. Tumanski,

Could we get the invoice soon to process the payment?

Best Regards,

Pada tanggal Sel, 25 Jan 2022 pukul 10.49 A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddig@poliupg.ac.id> menulis:

Dear Prof. Tumanski,

Sorry for the late reply, the invoice can be addressed to:

Name: Yiyin Klistafani, ST, MT.

Instituton: Politeknik Negeri Ujung Pandang

Address: Jalan Perintis Kemerdekaan KM. 10, Tamalanrea, Makassar 90245, Indonesia
Best Regards,

A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, M.Eng.Sc., Ph.D

Pada tanggal Rab, 12 Jan 2022 pukul 03.46 ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl> menulis:

Pada tanggal Rab, 12 Jan 2022 pukul 03.46 ST <tumanski@iumanski.pl> menulis:

Yhe first obligatory step is preparation by us the invoice. To prepare the invoice we need name and address of your university.

Next when you receive the invoice you can pay by credit card or by bank transfer as university or private.

The amount you can calculate by yourself — 35 Eu page b/w and 50E page incolour.

ee

Satu lampiran - Dipindai dengan Gmail ()

B3 PELO21_22.pdf 4



A. M. Shiddiq Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddig@poliupg.ac.id> @& 8Feb2022,10.04 “
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Dear Prof. Tumasnki,
Attached is the proof of APC payment for our manuscript (PEL/021/VT/22) on behalf of Yiyin Klistafani (First Author) via PayPal.
Best Regards,

Pada tanggal Sen, 7 Feb 2022 pukul 17.57 ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl> menulis:

Invoice enclosed.

You can pay by bank transfer or by credit card.

We recommend payments by credit cards using new possibility to pay by PayPal service because this way we receive the payment immediately.
To pay by this way please send us e-mail address and PayPal will contact with you on this address to help to pay. You can pay using your PayPal account (you can open such
account in a few second free of charge) or you can pay without PayPal account as a guest.

PayPal account is: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

You can also pay by bank transfer.
Important: if you pay by bank transfer always!!!! Send information about number of invoice PEL... because it is a method of identification of the
payment.

Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Warsaw University of Technology
IETiSIP

ul. Koszykowa 75

00-661 Warszawa

tel (mobile): 48 693 428 056
tel. (private): 48 22 711 0303
e-mail tumanski@tumanski.x.pl

Przeglad Elektrotechniczny (Electrical Review)
Editor in Chief

ul. Ratuszowa 11

00-950 Warszawa

e-mail: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

www.red.pe.org.pl
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----—--- FOrwarded message -------—-

Dari: ST <tumanski@tumanski.pl>

Date: Sel, 22 Feb 2022 pukul 19.47

Subject: RE: Manuscript Submission in Przegrad Elektrotechniczny Journal
To: A. M. Shiddig Yunus, ST, MEngSc, PhD <shiddig@poliupg.ac.id>

Please find your paper 6450 scheduled to April issue.
Best regards

Slawomir Tumanski

Professor

Przeglad Elektrotechniczny (Electrical Review)
Editor in Chief

ul. Ratuszowa 11

00-950 Warszawa

e-mail: red.pe@sigma-not.pl

www.red.pe.org.pl

tel (mobile): 48 693 428 056
tel. (private): 48 22 711 0303
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